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NOTICE TO ALL CONTRACTORS/SUPPLIERS 
 
1. All bids requested for in this bulletin are for the Mpumalanga Provincial Government, unless  
               otherwise stated. 
 
2. Adjudication of all bids will be in accordance with the PPPFA 
 
3. PERFORMANCE GUARANTEE REQUIREMENT 

 
The Mpumalanga Provincial Government has resolved to waive the requirement for a Performance Guarantee for all 
Projects/ Contracts for monetary values ranging from R0.1 up to R5.0 million. 
 

4. The requirement for an up-front payment of a Performance Guarantee shall remain applicable for Projects Construction 
Contracts whose monetary values exceed R5.0 million  
The following illustrates the above: 
Contract Value      % of Guarantee 
       Value required 
Over R5.0 million up to R6.0 million    6% 
Over R6.0 million up to R7.0 million    7% 
Over R 7.0 million up to R8.0 million   8% 
Over R8.0 million up to R9.0 million    9% 
From R9.01 million and above    10% 

 
5. RETENTION   

The Mpumalanga Provincial Government has further resolved that the deduction of retention monies from progress 
payments should remain in place as a security against any defaulters or in lieu of poor workmanship:  
 
5.1         BUILDING CONTRACTS IN GENERAL 

10% retention shall be deducted on any progres s payment certificate, until the total deducted retention value      
equal 5% of total contract/ project value.  The money shall be released at the expiry date of the retention period, 
which is normally a three-month period. 
 

5.2         ENGINEERING CONTRACTS 
10 % retention shall be deducted on any progress payment certificate, until the total retention value equals 10% 
of the total contract/ project value.  5% of the retention money shall be released immediately after practical 
completion of the project, with the remaining 5% being released as soon as practically possible, depending on   
the nature of the project e.g. the construction of a bridge. 
 

6.             All provincial departments shall henceforth apply the above provisions. 
 
7. Submission of tenders: 

 
a) Bids must be on the official bid forms, which must be filled in and completed in all respects. 
b) Bids must be submitted in sealed envelopes. 
c) Separate envelopes must be used for each bid invitation. 
d) The bid number and closing date must appear on the front of the envelope. 
e) The name and address of the bidder must, however, appear on the back of the envelope only. 
f) Bid documents can also be obtained from the Satellite offices  
g) Unless otherwise stated, all bids close at 12h00. 

 
8.  APPLICATION FOR TAX CLEARANCE CERTIFICATE (IN RESPECT OF BIDS) 

 
IT IS A CONDITION OF BID THAT- 
The taxes of the successful bidder MUST be in order, or that suitable arrangement has been made with the South 
African Receiver of Revenue to satisfy them. 
The SBD.2 form, Application for Tax Clearance Certificate (in respect of bids), must be completed by the bidder in 
all aspects and submitted to the Receiver of Revenue where the bidder is registered for income tax purposes.  That 
the Receiver of Revenue will then furnish the bidder with a Tax Clearance Certificate that will be valid for 12 months 
from date of issue.  This Tax Clearance Certificate must be submitted with the original bid, before the closing time 
and date of the bid.  Failure to submit an original and valid Tax Clearance Certificate MAY invalidate your bid. 

 
Each party to a Consortium/ Sub-Contractor must complete a separate Tax Clearance Certificate.  Copies of the 
Application for Tax Clearance Certificate are attached to every bid document and may also be obtainable at any 
Receiver of Revenue’s Office. 
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9. READING OUT OF BID PRICES 
 

Henceforth, only the prices of bids in the building, civil, mechanical and electrical works categories will be disclosed on 
request at the time of opening of bids. 
 

a) Tender submission results are read out to the public immediately after closure.   
b) No submission results will be faxed, emailed or made available telephonically by any of the Tender offices. 
c) Bidders can access this information also over the internet i.e http://treasury.mpg.gov.za   
d) Suppliers interested in the results, should arrange a representative or should attend the public reading directly 

after tender closures. 
e) Further note that due to the tender procedures required the names and bid offers will only be announced once; 

bidders who are late for the reading can unfortunately not be assisted with a second announcement. 
 
10.   LEVY 
 

Bidders are hereby advised that the Mpumalanga Provincial Government will only accept bank guaranteed cheque, cash 
or postal orders as payment for the bid levy.  Bidders are requested not to throw away their receipts for purchased bid 
documents.  NO EXCHANGES FOR CANCELLED OR WITHDRAWN TENDERS CAN BE MADE WITHOUT THE 
ORIGINAL RECEIPT 

 
11. The Mpumalanga Provincial Government requires of all bidders to provide details of their empowerment efforts and plans 

in the following key areas every time they submit bids: 
 

a) Directors/ Partners/ Members/ Owners  
 The number, role (executive/ non-executive) and influence (power) of Directors. 
b) Management 

The profile of the management structure, giving percentages of black participation across the levels (supervisor/ ju nior 
management/ middle management/ senior management).  The type of grading system used must be stated. 

c) Training and Development 
The Training and Development efforts must be stated – in the area of skills development for workers and management.  
The training expenditure as a percentage of payroll costs should be given. 

d) Joint Ventures 
The company must indicate any joint ventures it has with Blacks.  Specific details must be given to prove that such joint 
venture is genuine and real. 

e) Outsourcing 
The company must indicate which of its business activities (services/ goods) are provided by Black businesses. 

f) Sub-Contracting 
The company must indicate which part of the contract and for what value will be performed by a Black business out of the 
whole contract/ assignment it may secure value and benefit to communities. 

g) Equity Participation 
The bidder must provide information on the status of Black ownership in his/ her company. 

h) Other Empowerment Activities. 
The bidder would be free to supply other relevant empowerment details, which may not fall within the above-indicated 
framework. 

i) Industrial Relations Climate 
Sound Industrial Relations are a good measure not only to the extent of employee acceptance of the work -place 
environment, but also of the s tate of their empowerment.  If employees or their representatives are allowed and enabled to 
participate in key organizational processes, then a positive climate develops. 

 
This bulletin is issued by the Provincial Supply Chain Management offices, on behal f of Provincial Departments: 
Private Bag X11246   
Mbombela 1200   
 
(Please note that the above address is provided for general correspondence or applications to subscribe to receive this bulletin by 
post. It should not be used for submission of tender documents) 
 
Physical address: 
Visitors Centre 
Building no. 9 
Riverside Government Complex 
Bid Documentation Section 
 
For any enquiries, please contact: 
 
Ms.  TL Khathide 
Tel:   (013) 766 8259 
Fax: (013) 766 8455 
 

http://treasury.mpg.gov.za/
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Bid documents and other related bid/tender information are available from the 
following Supply Chain Management Offices:  
 
1. MBOMBELA 
       Riverside Government Complex 
       Building No 9, Government Boulevard, MBOMBELA, 1200 
       Telephone number: Mr. VS Ngobe (013) 766 6339 or Mr. J Sithole (013) 766 8258 or Mr. FH Mkhondo (013) 766 6394 or  Ms 
TL Khathide (013) 766 8259 Fax number: (013) 766 8455 
 

2. MALELANE 
       The Provincial Treasury 
       24 Air Street 
       Malelane 
       Contact Person: Mr. G Sibiya or Ms. DM Thobela: 013 7900 256  
       Fax No. : (013) 790 0514 
 

3.  SIYABUSWA 
Old Parliament Building, Building No.1, Job Skhosana Street, Siyabuswa, 0472 
Contact Person: Mr. Tsepho Ngwatle or Mr. Andries Mahlangu or Thabiso Molekwa     
Telephone number: (013) 973 0022/0106/0081 

 

4. MIDDELBURG 
  Department of Public Works 

       Cnr. Lillian Ngoyi and Dr Beyers Naudé Streets – Old TPA Building, Ground floor, Office numbers A5, A9  
       and 11 Contact Person: Ms. Lorraine Motebu or Ms. Mendy Kabini or Ms Linah Nethononda or Mr. KS Msiza or Ms. YM Bahula 
      Telephone number: (013) 282 8776 / 9151 
       Fax number: (013) 282 8776 
 

5. ELUKWATINI 
       Elukwatini Sub Regional offices  
      Office numbers A49 and A50 (opposite Elukwatini Community Hall) Stand number 12 Extension A, Elukwatini, 1190.  Contact  
      Person: Ms. P Nkosi: Telephone No: 017 883 1396/7 
 

6. PIET RETIEF 
      No. 11 Measroch Street, Piet Retief Office 
      Contact Person: Mr. Alex Shongwe 
      Telephone number: (017) 826 1671 
      Fax No: (017) 826 0577 

 
7. KWAMHLANGA 
       KwaMhlanga Government Complex 
      The Provincial Treasury, Building No. 12, Computer Centre 
      Contact Person: Ms. L Nethononda: 013 766 4872, Ms. E Mnguni: 013 766 4873,  
      Mr. MK Sibanyoni:   013 766 4886 or Mr. DE Mahlangu: 013 766 4875   
      Fax Number:  (013) 947 2250 
 

8. EVANDER 
       10 Corner Cornell and Aarhus Roads  (previously occupied by Evander Home  
       Affairs Offices), Evander, 2280 
       Contact Person: Ms. Martha Mahlangu or Ms. TV Manana or Ms. Jabulile Mavimbela  
       Telephone Number: (013) 766 1796 or 1794 or 1790 or 1795 
       Fax Number: (013) 766 7112 
 

9. BUSHBUCKRIDGE 
       The Provincial Treasury, R40 Road, Bakoena Business Complex, Bushbuckridge                 
       Contact Person: Ms. Mapula Kgotsoka, Ms. Patricia Shikwambana and Mr. Peterson Sithole: Ms. PT Mashego 
       Telephone Numbers:  013 799 0229 / 2125 
       Fax: (013) 799 0535 
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Please note that bid documents can be collected at any of the above-mentioned satellite offices, but 
bid/tender documents can ONLY BE SUBMITTED at the following Supply Chain Offices: 
 

Mbombela, Bushbuckridge, Malelane, KwaMhlanga, Middleburg, Siyabuswa, Evander, Piet Retief and 
Elukwatini 

Bid Submissions: 
 
1.     TAKE CARE NOT TO SEND DOCUMENTS TO THE ADVERTISING DEPARTMENTS AS THE BID 

CLOSURES ARE NOT ADMINISTERED BY INDIVIDUAL DEPARTMENTS 
 
2. TENDER DOCUMENTS SHOULD BE SUBMITTED IN ORIGINAL AND NO COPIES WILL BE ACCEPTED.   

 
3.    ALL TENDERS AND PROPOSALS SHOULD BE DELIVERED OR COURIERED TO THE FOLLOWING 

OFFICES, BEFORE THE CLOSING DATE AND TIME. 

 

4.     THE ADDRESS OF THE TENDERER, TENDER NUMBER AND CLOSING DATE MUST APPEAR ON THE 
FRONT OF THE ENVELOPE – DO NOT SUBMIT DIFFERENT TENDERS IN ONE ENVELOPE 

 
5.     TENDER BOXES ARE LOCATED AT THE FOLLOWING CLOSING CENTRES:  

 
MBOMBELA 

Riverside Government Complex 
Building No 9, Government Boulevard, Mbombela, 1200 
Telephone number: Mr. VS Ngobe (013) 766 6339 or Mr. J Sithole (013) 766 8258 or Mr. FH Mkhondo (013) 766 6394 or 
Ms. TL Khathide (013) 766 8259 
 

PIET RETIEF       
 No. 11 Measroch Street, Piet Retief Office 
 Contact Person: Mr. Alex Shongwe:   Telephone number:   (017) 826 1671 

KWAMHLANGA 
KwaMhlanga Government Complex 
The Provincial Treasury, Building No. 12, Computer Centre 
Contact Person: Ms. Linah Nethononda: 013 766 4872, Ms. Emily Mnguni: 013 766 4873, 
Mr. MK Sibanyoni:   013 766 4886 or Mr. DE Mahlangu:  013 766 4875 
      

EVANDER 
10 Corner Cornell and Aarhus Roads  (previously occupied by Evander Home  
Affairs Offices), Evander, 2280 
Contact Person: Ms. Martha Mahlangu or Ms. TV Manana or Ms. MJ Mavimbela 
Telephone Number: (013) 766 1796 or 1794 or 1790 or 1795 
 

BUSHBUCKRIDGE 
The Provincial Treasury, R40 Road, Bakoena Business Complex, Bushbuckridge                 
Contact Person: Ms. Mapula Kgotsoka, Ms. Patricia Shikwambana and Mr. Peterson Sithole: Ms. PT Mashego 

           Telephone Numbers:  013 799 0229 / 2125 
 

MIDDELBURG 
 Department of Public Works 

Cnr. Lillian Ngoyi and Dr Beyers Naudé Streets – Old TPA Building, Ground floor, Office numbers A5, A9  
and 11 Contact Person: Ms. Lorraine Motebu or Ms. Mendy Kabini or Ms. Linah Nethononda or Mr. KS Msiza or Ms. YM 
Bahula Telephone number: (013) 282 8776 / 9151 

MALELANE 
 The Provincial Treasury 

24 Air Street 
Malelane 
Contact Person: Mr. G Sibiya or Ms. DM Thobela: 013 7900 256 
Fax No. : (013) 790 0514 
 

ELUKWATINI 
Elukwatini Sub Regional offices Office numbers A49 and A50 (opposite Elukwatini Community Hall) Stand number 12 
Extension A, Elukwatini, 1190.  Contact Person: Ms. P Nkosi:      Telephone No: 017 883 1396/7 

SIYABUSWA 
Old Parliament Building, Building No.1, Job Skhosana Street, Siyabuswa, 0472 
Contact Person: Mr. Tsepho Ngwatle or Mr. Andries Mahlangu or Thabiso Molekwa     
Telephone number: (013) 973 0022/0106/0081 
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NOTICE ON CANCELLATION OF BIDS 
 

1) Notice is hereby given to all bidders and stakeholders, that the following bids have 

been cancelled.  

2) Where determined, these bids will accordingly be re-advertised at the discretion 
of the relevant Government institution. Where these bids are re-advertised, it will 
be required of bidders to produce original receipts of the initial purchase in order 
to receive the relevant bid document in line with the re-advertisement. 

 
 
CANCELLATION OF BIDS FOR DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE, RURAL DEVELOPMENT, 

LAND & ENVIRONMENTAL AFFAIRS 
 

 

No Description Bid number Reasons for 
cancellation 

1. Call for Expression of interest for the 

Development of Sunflower Oil 
Processing Plant and Soyabean Oil 
Processing Plant under Dr JS Moroka 

Local Municipality, Nkangala District 

ALA/576/24/MP No acceptable tenders 

were received 

 
 

CANCELLATION OF BID FOR DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY SAFETY, SECURITY AND 
LIAISON 
 

 

No Description Bid number Reasons for 
cancellation 

1. Provision of Grass and Trees Cutting, 

Weeds Removal and Gardening 
Services for the Mpumalanga 

Department of Community Safety, 
Security and Liaison  

SS/068/23/MP Bid validity period has 

expired 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 

CANCELLED/WITHDRAWAL BIDS  
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WITHDRAWAL OF PART OF BID TRADITIONAL COUNCILS PROJECTS OR SITES FOR 

DEPARTMENT OF CO-OPERATIVE GOVERNANCE AND TRADITIONAL AFFAIRS 
 

 
 

No. BID Description REASONS 

1 Appointment of one or more service providers 

for construction, paving and installation of 
fencing of Eight(08) for Traditional councils’ 
offices within Mpumalanga Province 

 (Amashangana TC) CGT/101/24/MP 

Disrupted Briefing session  

2 Appointment of one or more service providers 
for construction, paving and installation of 

fencing of Eight (08) for Traditional councils’ 
offices within Mpumalanga Province 
 (MabhokoTC) CGT/101/24MP 

Amended Annual Procurement Plan 

 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 



 
 

Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain Management Bid Bulletin/ Volume No. 333: 14 June 2024 

 
  

11 

 

 
 

BID NUMBER: ALA/403/24/MP 

 

Description: 

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF PIGS FOR MASIBUYELE ESIBAYENI IN 
ALL THE FOUR DISTRICTS (FAMERS) OF MPUMALANGA 

PROVINCE FOR A PERIOD OF 60 MONTHS 

Bid invited by: 
The Department of Agriculture, Rural Development, Land and Environmental 
Affairs 

Non-refundable fee:  
R100.00 payable in cash or bank guaranteed cheque made out to the Mpumalanga 
Provincial Government 

Compulsory Briefing 
Session: 

Date: 01 July 2024 
Time: 10h00 

Venue: Riverside Office Park Cycad Building, 
DARDLEA Ehlanzeni District Office, Mbombela. 

Date: 02 July 2024 

Time: 10h00 

Venue: 101 Main Road Thulamahashe, 

Bushbuckridge. 

Date: 03 July 2024 
Time: 10h00 

Venue:  Nooitgedacht Research Centre, Ermelo. 

Date: 04 July 2024 
Time: 10h00 

Venue: KwaMhlanga Government Complex, 
KwaMhlanga. 

 

Contact for  Bid enquiries, 

technical or specifications: 

Ms. PNZ Mpangane or Ms. P Makungo : 082 805 1076  or 066 485 5294 
Ms. NI Mbuyane or Ms. TV Dhludhlu     :  013 766 6118/6674 or      
NIMbuyane@mpg.gov.za or vmanana@mpg.gov.za  

Contact for availability of 
document:   

Provincial Supply Chain Management offices:   

013 766 6339, 8269  or 8258 or 6394 or 8259 
Where this document can 

be obtained: 
Any of the Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain offices: Refer to page 5 

Closing: Date: 17 July 2024 Time: 12h00 
Where this document must 
be submitted: 

Any of the eight regional branches, as specified on page 6 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

BID INVITATIONS 
 

mailto:NIMbuyane@mpg.gov.za
mailto:vmanana@mpg.gov.za
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BID NUMBER: CGT/028/24/MP  
 

Description: 

APPOINTMENT OF ONE OR MORE SERVICE PROVIDERS FOR THE 

PROVISION OF EVENTS CO-ORDINATION AND RELATED 
SERVICES TO THE DEPARTMENT OF CO-OPERATIVE 

GOVERNANCE AND TRADITIONAL AFFAIRS FOR A PERIOD OF 
THREE YEARS 

Bid invited by: The Department of Co-operative Governance & Traditional Affairs 

Non-refundable fee: 
R100.00 payable in cash or bank guaranteed cheque made out to the 
Mpumalanga Provincial Government 

Compulsory briefing 

session: 

Date: 27 June 2024 

Time: 10h00 

Legislature KwaMhlanga Government Complex  

Main Hall 

 
Date: 27 June 2024 
Time: 11h00 

Disaster Management centre R40 Road between 
Riverside and drumrock Mbombela 

 
Date: 27 June 2024 
Time: 12h00 

Gert Sibande District Offices Main Hall Ermelo 

Contact for  Bid enquiries, 

technical or specifications: 

Ms. EE Sibiya       :           013 766 6990 or esibiya@mpg.gov.za  

Mr JS Mzobe                :           013 766 6245 or JMzobe@mpg.gov.za   

Contact for availability of 

document: 

Provincial Supply Chain Management offices:   

013 766 6339, 8269  or 8258 or 6394 or 8259 
Where this document can 
be obtained: 

Any of the Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain offices: Refer to page 5 

Closing: Date: 19 July 2024 Time: 12h00 
Where this document must 
be submitted: 

Any of the eight regional branches, as specified on page 6 

 
 
 

BID NUMBER: CGT/070/24/MP  
 

Description: 

APPOINTMENT OF A SERVICE PROVIDER FOR PROFESSIONAL 
SERVICES FOR FINANCIAL REPORTING, INTERNAL CONTROL 

AND ASSET MANAGEMENT RELATING TO MUNICIPALITIES 
WITHIN THE MPUMALANGA PROVINCE FOR A PERIOD OF THREE 

(03) YEARS 
Bid invited by: The Department of Co-operative Governance & Traditional Affairs 

Non-refundable fee: 
R100.00 payable in cash or bank guaranteed cheque made out to the 
Mpumalanga Provincial Government 

Compulsory briefing 
session: 

Date: 27 June 2024 
Time: 11h00 

Legislature KwaMhlanga Government Complex  
Main Hall 

 
Date: 27 June 2024 

Time: 12h00 

Disaster Management centre R40 Road between 

Riverside and drumrock Mbombela 

 
Date: 27 June 2024 
Time: 10h00 

Gert Sibande District Offices Main Hall Ermelo 

Contact for  Bid enquiries, 
technical or specifications: 

Mr. S Kunene         :           013 766 6591 or skunene@mpg.gov.za  
Mr JS Mzobe           :           013 766 6615 or BMJiyane@2mpg.gov.za  

Contact for availability of 
document: 

Provincial Supply Chain Management offices:   

013 766 6339, 8269  or 8258 or 6394 or 8259 
Where this document can 

be obtained: 
Any of the Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain offices: Refer to page 5 

Closing: Date: 19 July 2024 Time: 12h00 
Where this document must 
be submitted: 

Any of the eight regional branches, as specified on page 6 

mailto:esibiya@mpg.gov.za
mailto:JMzobe@mpg.gov.za
mailto:skunene@mpg.gov.za
mailto:BMJiyane@2mpg.gov.za
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BID NUMBER: CGT/078/24/MP  
 

Description: 

APPOINTMENT OF ONE OR MORE SERVICE PROVIDER/S FOR 
DEBT COLLECTION SERVICES WITHIN THE MPUMALANGA 

PROVINCE FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS  
Bid invited by: The Department of Co-operative Governance & Traditional Affairs 

Non-refundable fee: 
R100.00 payable in cash or bank guaranteed cheque made out to the 
Mpumalanga Provincial Government 

Compulsory briefing 

session: 

Date: 27 June 2024 

Time: 12h00 

Legislature KwaMhlanga Government Complex  

Main Hall 

 
Date: 27 June 2024 

Time: 10h00 

Disaster Management centre R40 Road between 

Riverside and drumrock Mbombela 

 
Date: 27 June 2024 
Time: 11h00 

Gert Sibande District Offices Main Hall Ermelo 

Contact for  Bid enquiries, 

technical or specifications: 

Mr S Kunene         :           013 766 6591 or skunene@mpg.gov.za  

Mr EE Sibiya           :           013 766 6969 or esibiya@mpg.gov.za  

Contact for availability of 

document: 

Provincial Supply Chain Management offices:   

013 766 6339, 8269  or 8258 or 6394 or 8259 
Where this document can 
be obtained: 

Any of the Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain offices: Refer to page 5 

Closing: Date: 19 July 2024 Time: 12h00 
Where this document must 
be submitted: 

Any of the eight regional branches, as specified on page 6 

 
 
 
 

BID NUMBER: CGT/104/24/MP  
 

Description: 

APPOINTMENT OF ONE OR MORE SERVICE PROVIDERS FOR 

CONSTRUCTION, PAVING AND INSTALLATION OF FENCING FOR 
TRADITIONAL COUNCILS’ OFFICES AROUND MPUMALANGA 

PROVINCE (AMASHANGANA TC) 
Bid invited by: The Department of Co-operative Governance & Traditional Affairs 

Non-refundable fee: 
R100.00 payable in cash or bank guaranteed cheque made out to the 
Mpumalanga Provincial Government 

CIDB Grading 5 GB OR ABOVE 

Compulsory briefing 
session: 

Date: 28 June 2024 
Time: 11h00 

Amashangana Traditional Council New Forest 
Bushburgridge 

Contact for  Bid enquiries, 

technical or specifications: 

Mr. T Mutavayi  : 076 295 3313  or Ted.mutavayi@gmail.com   

Mr. EE Sibiya  : 013 766 6969/90  esibiya@mpg.gov.za   

Contact for availability of 

document: 

Provincial Supply Chain Management offices:   

013 766 6339, 8269  or 8258 or 6394 or 8259 
Where this document can 
be obtained: 

Any of the Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain offices: Refer to page 5 

Closing: Date: 08 July 2024 Time: 12h00 
Where this document must 
be submitted: 

Any of the eight regional branches, as specified on page 6 

 
 
 
 

mailto:skunene@mpg.gov.za
mailto:esibiya@mpg.gov.za
mailto:Ted.mutavayi@gmail.com
mailto:esibiya@mpg.gov.za
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BID NUMBER: CGT/105/24/MP  
 

Description: 

APPOINTMENT OF A SERVICE PROVIDERS FOR THE PROVISION 
OF VALUE ADDED TAX AUDIT, REVIEW, AND RECOVERY FOR 

MUNICIPALITIES FOR A PERIOD OF 36 MONTHS WITHIN 
MPUMALANGA PROVINCE 

Bid invited by: The Department of Co-operative Governance & Traditional Affairs 

Non-refundable fee: 
R100.00 payable in cash or bank guaranteed cheque made out to the 
Mpumalanga Provincial Government 

Compulsory briefing 

session: 

Date: 28 June 2024 

Time: 12h00 

Legislature KwaMhlanga Government Complex  

Main Hall 

 
Date: 28 June 2024 
Time: 10h00 

Disaster Management centre R40 Road between 
Riverside and drumrock Mbombela 

 
Date: 28 June 2024 
Time: 11h00 

Gert Sibande District Offices Main Hall Ermelo 

Contact for  Bid enquiries, 

technical or specifications: 

Mr S Kunene         :           013 766 6591 or skunene@mpg.gov.za  

Mr EE Sibiya           :           013 766 6969 or esibiya@mpg.gov.za   

Contact for availability of 
document: 

Provincial Supply Chain Management offices:   

013 766 6339, 8269  or 8258 or 6394 or 8259 
Where this document can 
be obtained: 

Any of the Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain offices: Refer to page 5 

Closing: Date: 19 July 2024 Time: 12h00 
Where this document must 
be submitted: 

Any of the eight regional branches, as specified on page 6 

 
 
 
 

BID NUMBER: SS/068/24/MP Re-Advertisiment   
 

Description: 

PROVISION OF GRASS AND TREES CUTTING, WEEDS REMOVAL 
AND GARDENING SERVICES FOR THE MPUMALANGA 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY SAFETY, SECURITY AND LIAISON 

AS AN WHEN REQUIRED FOR A PERIOD OF (05) FIVE YEARS 
 

Bid invited by: The Department of Community Safety, Security & Liaison 

Non-refundable fee: 
R100.00 payable in cash or bank guaranteed cheque made out to the 

Mpumalanga Provincial Government 

Contact for  Bid enquiries, 
technical or specifications: 

Ms. SJ  Sibiya                    :     013 766 4441 or ssibiya@mpg.gov.za 
Mr. NL Maphanga              :     013 766 7290 or NLMaphanga@mpg.gov.za 

Contact for availability of 

document: 

Provincial Supply Chain Management offices:   

013 766 6339, 8269  or 8258 or 6394 or 8259 
Where this document can 

be obtained: 
Any of the Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain offices: Refer to page 5 

Closing: Date: 16 JULY 2024 Time: 12h00 
Where this document must 
be submitted: 

Any of the eight regional branches, as specified on page 6 

 
 
 

mailto:skunene@mpg.gov.za
mailto:esibiya@mpg.gov.za
mailto:ssibiya@mpg.gov.za
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BID NUMBER: PWRT/2581/24/MP ADDENDUM 

  
 

Description: 

CONSTRUCTION OF A NEW OVERHEAD RAILWAY CROSSING BRIDGE 
INTERCHANGE ON THE EMALAHLENI TO VERENA PROVINCIAL ROAD 
P100 IN THE EMALAHLENI LOCAL MUNICIPALITY IN THE NKANGALA 

REGION OF THE MPUMALANGA PROVINCE 
Bid invited by: 

 
The Department of Public Works, Roads and Transport 

CIDB Grading 8 CE OR HIGHER 

Non-refundable fee: 
R200.00 payable in cash or bank guaranteed cheque made out to the 

Mpumalanga Provincial Government 

Compulsory briefing 

session 

DATE: 24 May 2024 

TIME : 11:00 

Venue: Railway Crossing in Emalahleni towards 
Verena on Road P100, Emalahleni 

-25.8670701 S,  29.2099126 E   

Contact for  Bid enquiries, 

technical or specifications: 

Mr. E.J Baloyi        : 013 766 8529  or baloyie@mpg.gov.za 

Mr. Ken Muli          : 071 608 1768  or ken.muli@msw.za.com 

Contact for availability of 

document: 

Provincial Supply Chain Management offices:   

013 766 6339, 8269  or 8258 or 6394 or 8259 
Where this document can 

be obtained: 
Any of the Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain offices: Refer to page 5 

Closing: Date: 28 JUNE 2024 Time: 12h00 
Where this document must 
be submitted: 

Any of the eight regional branches, as specified on page 6 

 
 

 

BID NUMBER: PWRT/2582/24/MP ADDENDUM 

  
 

Description: 

REHABILITATION OF THE FLOOD DAMAGED BRIDGE ON ROAD D2943 
AT MLUMATI RIVER CROSSING IN DRIEKOPIES IN THE NKOMAZI LOCAL 

MUNICIPALITY IN THE EHLANZENI REGION OF THE MPUMALANGA 
PROVINCE 

Bid invited by: 

 
The Department of Public Works, Roads and Transport 

CIDB Grading 8 CE OR HIGHER 

Non-refundable fee: 
R200.00 payable in cash or bank guaranteed cheque made out to the 

Mpumalanga Provincial Government 

Compulsory briefing 

session 

DATE: 23 May 2024 

TIME : 11:00 

Venue: Mlumati River Crossing near Driekoppies 
on road D2943 
 25o41’02.32’’S,  31o32’16.56’’E   

Contact for  Bid enquiries, 

technical or specifications: 

Mr. E.J Baloyi                   : 013 766 8529  or baloyie@mpg.gov.za 

Mr. Harry Mtshweni          : 012 344 4025  or harrym@vukaafrica.co.za   

Contact for availability of 

document: 

Provincial Supply Chain Management offices:   

013 766 6339, 8269  or 8258 or 6394 or 8259 
Where this document can 

be obtained: 
Any of the Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain offices: Refer to page 5 

Closing: Date: 28 JUNE 2024 Time: 12h00 
Where this document must 
be submitted: 

Any of the eight regional branches, as specified on page 6 

 

mailto:baloyie@mpg.gov.za
mailto:ken.muli@msw.za.com
mailto:baloyie@mpg.gov.za
mailto:harrym@vukaafrica.co.za
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BID NUMBER: MTPA/20242025/PMU/02  ADDENDUM 

 

DESCRIPTION OF 

REQUIREMENT 

APPOINTMENT OF A SERVICE PROVIDER FOR THE 
CONSTRUCTION OF THE BULK WATER SUPPLY AT BLYDE 
RIVER CANYON NATURE RESERVE-POTHOLES 

 

BID NUMBER 

 

MTPA/20242025/PMU/02 

CIDB GRADING CIDB GRADE 6GB/CE AND ABOVE WILL BE CONSIDERED 

 

NAME OF INSTITUTION 

 

MPUMALANGA TOURISM AND PARKS AGENCY 

PLACE WHERE GOODS, 

WORKS OR SERVICES ARE 

REQUIRED 

SUPPLY CHAIN MANAGEMENT, N4 NATIONAL ROAD, BLOCK E, MTPA  

OFFICE COMPLEX, SAMORA MACHEL DRIVE, HALL’S GETAWAY, 

MATAFFIN, MBOMBELA 

CLOSING DATE AND TIME OF 

BID 

 

DATE:  28 June 2024                           TIME: 11:00 AM  

 

CONTACT DETAILS 

 

PHYSICAL ADDRESS: SUPPLY CHAIN MANAGEMENT OFFICE, N4 

NATIONAL ROAD, BLOCK E, MTPA  OFFICE COMPLEX, SAMORA 

MACHEL DRIVE, HALL’S GETAWAY, MATAFFIN, MBOMBELA  

 

POSTAL ADDRESS : PRIVATE BAG X11338, NELSPRUIT, 1200  

 

TELEPHONE NUMBERS: 013 065 0888  

CONTACT PERSON (TECHNICAL ENQUIRIES): Mr. Themba Betuel 

E-MAIL ADDRESS: Themba.Betuel@mtpa.co.za 013 065 0888 

 

CONTACT PERSON (SCM ENQUIRIES): Mr. Evans Ngwenya 

E-MAIL ADDRESS:  Evans.Ngwenya@mtpa.co.za 013 065 0886 

COLLECTION OR ACCESSING THE 

BID DOCUMENT CAN BE 

COLLECTED 

Bid documents will be available for collection on MTPA website 

(www.mpumalanga.com) or at the Supply Chain Management Office, N4 

National Road, Block E at the MTPA Office Complex, Samora Machel 

Drive, Hall’s, Mataffin, Nelspruit between 07:30am – 13:00 and 14:00 – 

16:00. Bid documents collected at MTPA Complex Office are available at a 

non-refundable cost of R200-00. 

PLACE WHERE BID DOCUMENT 

MUST BE DELIVERED / DEPOSITED 

All proposals and supporting documents must be clearly marked “TENDER 

REFERENCE NUMBER” and submitted to Supply Chain Management 

Office of the Chief Financial Officer, Private Bag X11338, Nelspruit, 1200 

or hand delivered to the Tender Box, Block E at the MTPA Office Complex, 

Samora Machel Drive, Hall’s, Mataffin, Nelspruit, 1200 on or before  28 

June 2024 at 11h00 

COMPULSORY BRIEFING 

SESSION/SITE VISIT 

NON-COMPULSORY 

 
 
 
 

mailto:Themba.Betuel@mtpa.co.za
mailto:Priscilla.Gwebu@mtpa.co.za
http://www.mpumalanga.com/
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BID NUMBER: MEGA/2024/03  

 

DESCRIPTION OF 

REQUIREMENT 

BID FOR THE APPOINTMENT OF A PANEL OF LEGAL 

ADVISORY/ATTORNEYS TO MEGA FOR A PERIOD OF 

THREE (3) YEARS 

 

BID NUMBER 

 

MEGA/2024/03 

 

NAME OF INSTITUTION 

 

MPUMALANGA ECONOMIC GROWTH AGENCY 

 

PLACE WHERE GOODS, 

WORKS OR SERVICES ARE 

REQUIRED 

 

MBOMBELA, MEGA OFFICE PARK, 02 EASTERN BOULEVARD 

RIVERSIDE, 1200 

 

CLOSING DATE AND TIME OF 

BID 

 

DATE:  10 JULY 2024                            TIME: 12:00 PM  

 

CONTACT DETAILS 

 

 

PHYSICAL ADDRESS: MEGA OFFICE PARK 02 EASTERN 

BOULEVARD, RIVERSIDE, MBOMBELA 

 

POSTAL ADDRESS : PO BOX 1330 NELSPRUIT, 1200  

 

TELEPHONE NUMBERS: 087 756 7577 

 

CONTACT PERSON (TECHNICAL ENQUIRIES): Ms. CYNTHIA NKUNA 

CONTACT NUMBER: 013 492 5818/7 

E-MAIL ADDRESS: Cynthia.nkuna@mega.gov.za  

 

CONTACT PERSON (SCM ENQUIRIES): Mrs. BN MAHLALELA 

CONTACT NUMBER: 013 492 5818/7 

E-MAIL ADDRESS:  Bridgette.mahlalela@mega.gov.za   

COLLECTION OR ACCESSING THE 

BID DOCUMENT CA BE COLLECTED 

TENDER DOCUMENTS ARE FOR FREE AND INTERESTED PARTIES 

MAY DOWNLOAD THEM FROM THE ETENDERS PUBLICATION. 

WHERE THERE ARE CHALLENGES WHEN DOWN LOADING THE 

TENDER DOCUMENTS, BIDERS CAN REQUEST IT DIRECTLY FROM 

MEGA (Bridgette.mahlalela@mega.gov.za) 

PLACE WHERE BID DOCUMENT 

MUST BE DELIVERED / DEPOSITED 

ALL THE BID DOCUMENTS TOGETHER WITH THE SUPPORTING 

DOCUMENTS MUST BE SUBMITTED ON SEALED ENVELOPE, MARKED 

WITH THE NAME AND ADDRESS OF THE SERVICE PROVIDERS, BID 

NUMBER, BID DESCRIPTION AND CLOSING DATE AND BE DEPOSITED 

IN THE TENDER BOX LOCATED AT MEGA OFFICE PARK 02 EASTERN 

BOULEVARD, RIVERSIDE, MBOMBELA BEFORE 10 July 2024 at 12h00 

 

COMPULSORY BRIEFING 

SESSION/SITE VISIT 

 

NO COMPULSORY BRIEFING  

 
 

mailto:Cynthia.nkuna@mega.gov.za
mailto:Bridgette.mahlalela@mega.gov.za
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BID NUMBER: MER/T01/2025 

 

DESCRIPTION OF REQUIREMENT 
PROVISION OF AN INTEGRATED IT SOLUTION FOR 

GAMBLING AND LIQUOR REGULATION 

 

BID NUMBER 

 

MER/T01/2025 

 

NAME OF INSTITUTION 

 

MPUMALANGA ECONOMIC REGULATOR 

 

PLACE WHERE GOODS, WORKS OR 

SERVICES ARE REQUIRED 

 

MPUMALANGA ECONOMIC REGULATOR, FIRST AVENUE, WHITE 

RIVER, 1240 

 

CLOSING DATE AND TIME OF BID 

 

DATE:  12 JULY 2024                          TIME: 11:00 AM 

 

CONTACT DETAILS 

 

 

PHYSICAL ADDRESS:  AT MER BUILDING, FIRST AVENUE, WHITE 

RIVER, 1240, MPUMALANGA PROVINCE, SOUTH AFRICA. 

POSTAL ADDRESS :  PRIVATE BAG X 9908, WHITE RIVER, 1240 

TELEPHONE NUMBERS: 013 750 8000,FAX +27 (0)13 750 8099 

  

CONTACT PERSON (TECHNICAL ENQUIRIES):  CHIEF FINANCIAL 

OFFICER, AT scm@mer.org.za. 013750 8000 

   

COLLECTION OR ACCESSING THE 

BID DOCUMENT CA BE COLLECTED 

BID DOCUMENTS MAY BE OBTAINED FROM THE MER’S WEBSITE 

WWW.MER.ORG.ZA  AND ON NATIONAL TREASURY’S E-TENDER 

PORTAL.  THE PHYSICAL ADDRESS FOR COLLECTION AND 

SUBMISSION OF TENDER DOCUMENTS IS: MPUMALANGA 

ECONOMIC REGULATOR, FIRST AVENUE, WHITE RIVER,1240 

PLACE WHERE BID DOCUMENT 

MUST BE DELIVERED / DEPOSITED 

BIDS MUST BE PROPERLY RECEIVED, CLEARLY MARKED AND 

DEPOSITED IN THE TENDER BOX ON OR BEFORE THE CLOSING 
DATE AND BEFORE THE CLOSING TIME AT THE MER OFFICE 
SITUATED AT: 

MER BUILDING 

FIRST AVENUE, WHITE RIVER MPUMALANGA SOUTH AFRICA 

 

COMPULSORY BRIEFING 

SESSION/SITE VISIT 

 

26 JUNE 2024 AT 10:00AM, MPUMALANGA ECONOMIC REGULATOR,  
FIRST AVENUE, WHITE RIVER, 1240.   

                         

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

mailto:scm@mer.org.za
http://www.mer.org.za/
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AWARDED BID FOR AGRICULTURE, RURAL DEVELOPMENT, LAND & 
ENVIRONMENTAL AFFAIRS 
 
 
NO BID DESCRIPTION  BID NO. APPOINTED 

SUPPLIER 
PROVIDER 

BID AMOUNT  

1 Request for proposal from 
credible, capable, and 

experienced management 
company to capacitate, operate, 

and manage the Mpumalanga 
international fresh produce 
market at the City of Mbombela 

Local Municipality 

ALA/577/24/MP BNH Joint 
Consortium 

(Pty) Ltd 

N/A 

 
 
AWARDED BIDS FOR COMMUNITY SAFETY, SECURITY AND LIAISON 
 
No BID DESCRIPTION  BID NO. APPOINTED 

SUPPLIER 
PROVIDER 

AMOUNT 

1 The Supply, Delivery installation 

and maintenance of hygiene 
equipment and supply hygiene 
chemicals in Mpumalanga 

Department of Community Safety, 
Security and Liaison as and when 

required for a period of five (05) 
years   

SS/072/23/MP CEBISANI 

PROJECTS 
(PTY) LTD 

 PRICE/RATE  

NEGOTIATION 

2 Provision of Events Management 

for Mpumalanga Department of 
Community Safety, Security and 
Liaison in Head Office, Ehlanzeni, 

Gert Sibande and Nkangala 
Region for a period of (05) five 

years  

SS/049/23/MP 1.RNK 

HOLDINGS 
(PTY) LTD 
2.AFROSHINE 

HOLDINGS 

PRICE/RATE 

NEGOTIATION 

3 The supply and delivery of Traffic 
Law Enforcement Uniform for 
Mpumalanga Department of 

Community Safety, Security and 
Liaison for a period of (05) five 

years  

SS/047/23/MP 1.DREAMING 
LARGE (PTY) 
LTD 

2.BASTUMILE 
PROJECTS 

(PTY) LTD 

PRICE/RATE 
NEGOTIATION 

 

 

AWARDED BIDS  
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AWARDED BIDS FOR CULTURE, SPORT & RECREATION 
 
NO BID DESCRIPTION BID NO. APPOINTED 

SUPPLIER 
PROVIDER 

AMOUNT 

1. Provision of travelling and 

accommodation for government 
and non-government employees 
for a period of five (05) years in 

Mpumalanga Province. 

CSR/024/23/MP Phumi Malangu 

Tours 
Vakasha Travel 
Lehejequ Trading 

N/A 

2. Provision of internet services 
(Installation, Connectivity and 

Maintenance) for 
Puclec/Regional Libraries, 
Museumand Heritage sites for a 

period of five (05) year in 
Mpumalanga Province. 

CSR/094/23/MP Compulsol IT 
Technologies 

N/A 

3. Provision, Implementation and 

Hosting of the Library 
Management System in 
Mpumalanga Province for a 

period of five (05) years 

CSR/119/23/MP Ingwetele 

Wireless (Pty) Ltd 

N/A 

4. Provision of Sport Science and 
Medical Services (SSMS) for a 

period of five (05) years in 
Mpumalanga Province. 

CSR/117/23/MP Mpilokamfana 
Gift Physios and 

Partners 

N/A 

5. Appointment of Service Provider 

for the Installation, Repair and 
Service Anti-Theft detection 
device for Public Libraries for the 

period of five (05) years 

CSR/126/23/MP Mabapa Trading N/A 

6. Provision, Supply and Delivery of 
Quality Sport Equipment and 

Attire a period of five (05) years 
in Mpumalanga Province 

CSR/118/23/MP Prodipix 
Sneak Empire 

New Elestination 
Corner Stone 
Trading 

N/A 

7. Provision of Cleaning and 
Gardening services for 
Mpumalanga Archives 

Mbombela for the period of five 
(05) years 

CSR/113/23/MP Ophinix  N/A 
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AWARDED BIDS FOR HEALTH 
 
NO BID DESCRIPTION BID NO. APPOINTED SERVICE 

PROVIDER 

AMOUNT  

1 Supply and delivery 

of  Linen to all 
hospitals in 

Department of Health 
for a period of three 
(03) years 

HEAL/198/23/MP Dvolokhulu Trading, 

Lehejequ Trading, 
Mochabane Medical,                               

Times Ten Trading 
Enterprise,           
Thato Ya Ona Trading 

Enterprise 

NEGOTIATED 

RATES 

2 Supply and delivery 
of Nurses Uniform to 

Health institution and 
facilities for a period 
of three (03) years 

HEAL/274/23/MP Majamangezakhe Tansport  
Njilo Trading Solutions        

SM Ngomane Holdings        
Times Ten Trading 
Enterprise 

NEGOTIATED 
RATES 

3  Supply and delivery 

of laundry chemicals 
for a period of three 

(3) years  

HEAL/113/23/MP Mavelakhashane pty ltd,  

Mpumistone Projects, 
Khula Zikode General 

Trading,  
Striving Mind Trading 22,  
Sthezwe Business 

Enterprise,  
S and L Avenue pty ltd,  

Siphoselanga Business 
Enterprise cc 

NEGOTIATED 

RATES 

4 Supply, Delivery and 
Commissioning of the 

Video Athroscopy 
machine and 

accessories (Rob 
Ferrreira) 

HEAL/177/23/MP Stryker South Africa pty ltd R1 652 749,90 

5 Supply, Delivery and 

Commissioning of the 
Mammography 
machines Witbank 

Hospital and Rob 
Ferreira Hospital 

HEAL/255/23/MP Lomaen Medical Projects R9 934 448,91 

6 Supply, Delivery and 

Commissioning of the 
Digital X-Ray unit at 
Rob Ferreira  hospital 

HEAL/272/23/MP Lomaen Medical Projects R4 623 322,71 

7 Supply, delivery and 

commissioning of the 
digital mobile Xray 

units for the period of 
three (3) years to the 
Mpumalanga 

HEAL/256/23/MP Lomaen Medical Projects Negotiated 

rates 
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Department of Health 

( as and when 
required) 

8 Supply, Delivery and 
Commissioning of the  
128-Slice CT 

Scan(Rob Ferreira 
Hospital) 

HEAL/257/23/MP Lomaen Medical Projects Negotiated 
rates 

9 Supply, Delivery and 

Commissioning of the 
MRI machine (Rob 

Ferreira) 

HEAL/251/23/MP Tecmed  Negotiated 

rates 

10 Supply, delivery, and 
commissioning of 
head/skull clamp (x1) 

Rob Ferreira hospital 
in Mpumalanga 

Province 

HEAL/263/23/MP Mbuso Medical Supplies R1 488 742,50 

11 Provision of catering 
services at Evander 
regional training 

centre (RTC) at 
Evander regional 

training centre for 
Mpumalanga 
Department of Health 

for a period of two 
(02) years  

HEAL/199/23/MP The Hope Mandate Negotiated 
rates 

12 Supply, Delivery, and 

commissioning of the 
Cot Bed, Infant with 
rising Backrest (x111) 

for various facilities  

HEAL/264/23/MP Mamello  R1 718 360,48 

13 Supply, Delivery, and 
commissioning of 

Infusion Pumps 
(x195) for various 

facilities 

HEAL/265/23/MP Sanbonani Holdings R1 926 600,00 

14 Supply, Delivery, and 
commissioning of the 
Amplitude 

Electroencephlograph 
AEEG (X4) for 

various facilities 

HEAL/267/23/MP Mbuso Medical Supplies NEGOTIATED 
RATES 

15 Supply, Delivery, and 
commissioning of 
delivery bed, Electric 

(x82) for various 
facilities 

HEAL/268/23/MP Tara Health Technology R4 667 850,00 



 
 

Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain Management Bid Bulletin/ Volume No. 333: 14 June 2024 

 
  

23 

 
 
AWARDED BIDS FOR SOCIAL DEVELOPMENT  
 
NO BID DESCRIPTION  BID NO. PERIO

D 

APPOINTED 

SERVICE 
PROVIDER  

EFFECTIVE 

DATE  

1 Supply and delivery of 

Social relief of distress 
items as and when 
required at Ehlanzeni 

District for the 
Department of Social 

Development for a period 
of 5 years  
 

 
 

 
 
 

SOC/026/23/MPA  5 Years  Kholwane 

Investment  

01/05/2024 

2 Supply and delivery of 

Social relief of distress 
items as and when 

required at Ehlanzeni 
District for the 
Department of Social 

Development for a period 
of 5 years 

 

SOC/026/23/MPA 5 years  Siqogo 

Trading 
Enterprise 

01/05/2024 

3 Supply and delivery of 
Social relief of distress 
items as and when 

required at Nkangala 
District for the 

Department of Social 
Development for a period 
of 5 years 

 

SOC/026/23/MP B 5 Years  TN Group 
Suppliers and 
Trading 

Enterprise 
(PTY) LTD 

01/05/2024 

4 Supply and delivery of 
Social relief of distress 

items as and when 
required at Nkangala 

District for the 
Department of Social 
Development for a period 

of 5 years 
 

SOC/026/23/MP B 5 Years  Greatlinking 
Management 

Services (PTY) 
LTD 

01/05/2024 
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5 Supply and delivery of 

Social relief of distress 
items as and when 

required at Nkangala 
District for the 
Department of Social 

Development for a period 
of 5 years 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 

SOC/026/23/MP B 5 Years  Buuzeka 

Trading  

01/05/2024 

6 Supply and delivery of 

Social relief of distress 
items as and when 
required at Gert Sibande 

District for the 
Department of Social 

Development for a period 
of 5 years 
 

SOC/026/23/MP C 5 Years  Kasi Malitha 

(PTY) LTD 

01/05/2024 

7 Supply and delivery of 

Social relief of distress 
items as and when 

required at Gert Sibande 
District for the 
Department of Social 

Development for a period 
of 5 years 

 

SOC/026/23/MP C 5 Years  Cozza 

Transport CC 

01/05/2024 

8 Supply and delivery of 
Social relief of distress 
items as and when 

required at Gert Sibande 
District for the 

Department of Social 
Development for a period 
of 5 years 

 

SOC/026/23/MP C 5 Years  Blast Security 
Services (PTY) 
LTD 

01/05/2024 
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EXTENSION OF VALIDITY PERIOD FOR BID FOR THE DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE, RURAL 
DEVELOPMENT, LAND AND ENVIRONMENTAL AFFAIRS 
 

 

NO ITEM DESCRIPTION BID NO. EXTENSION OF 

VALIDITY PERIOD 

FROM 

VALIDITY PERIOD 

EXTENDED TO 

1. Panel of service providers for 

supplying, delivery, offloading, 
installation, and commissioning of 
fencing material in the Mpumalanga 

Province for a period of 60 months (5) 
years. 

ALA/575/24/MP 06 June 2024 05 July 2024 

 
 

EXTENSION OF VALIDITY PERIOD FOR BID FOR THE DEPARTMENT OF CULTURE,  SPORT AND 
RECREATION  

 

 
No. DESCRIPTIONS BID NO CLOSING 

DATE OF 

BID 

BID 

EXPIRY 

DATE 

BID VALIDITY 

EXTENSION 

(30 DAYS) 

1. APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE 

PROVIDER FOR THE PROVISION 

OF OFFICE FURNITURE AND 

EQUIPMENT IN MPUMALANGA 

REGIONAL, PUBLIC LIBRARIES 

AND DEPARTMENTAL OFFICES 

AS AND WHEN REQUIRED FOR A 

PERIOD OF FIVE (05) YEARS IN 

MPUMALANGA PROVINCE. 

 

 

 

 

CSR/107/23/MP 

 

 

 

 

06/03/ 2024 

 

 

 

 

06/06/2024 

 

 

 

 

05/08/2024 

2. APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE 

PROVIDER FOR THE PROVISION, 

SUPPLY OF MULTI-

FUNCTIONING PHOTOCOPYING 

MACHINE FOR HEAD OFFICE 

AND ALL DISTRICT FOR THE 

PERIOD OF FIVE (05) YEARS IN 

MPUMALANGA PROVINCE. 

 

 

CSR/098/23/MP 

 

 

06/03/2024 

 

 

06/06/2024 

 

 

05/08/2024 

3. APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE 

PROVIDER FOR THE PROVISION 

OF HYGIENE SERVICES AND 

WHEN REQUIRED FOR A PERIOD 

OF FIVE (05) YEARS IN 

MPUMALANGA PROVINCE. 

CSR/112/23/MP 08/03/2024 10/06/2024 09/08/2024 

 
 

 
 

 

 

ANNEXURE A :EXTENSIONS OF VALIDITY PERIOD   
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EXTENSION OF VALIDITY PERIOD FOR VARIOUS BIDS FOR DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS, ROADS & 

TRANSPORT 

 
No. Description Tender No. Closing 

Date for Bid 

Bid Validity 

Expiry Date 

(90 Days) 

Bid 

Validity 

Extension 

(90 Days) 

1. REHABILITATION OF PROVINCIAL 
ROAD D636 (AIRPORT ROAD) 
BETWEEN ROAD D812 AND D2276 

(KM 8.79 TO KM 21.02) IN THE 
MBOMBELA LOCAL MUNICIPALITY 
IN THE EHLANZENI REGION OF THE 

MPUMALANGA PROVINCE 
(12.23KM). 

PWRT/2554/23/MP 24 
November 
2023 

24 May 2024 24 August 
2024 

2. REHABILITATION AND UGRADING 
OF ROAD D2571 FROM R37 

INTERSECTION TO P171/1 
INTERSECTION (LYDENBURG PASS) 
IN THE THABA CHEWU LOCAL 

MUNICIPALITY IN THE EHLANZENI 
REGION OF MPUMALANGA 
PROVINCE (13.4KM) 

PWRT/2556/23/MP 24 
November 

2023 

24 May 2024 24 August 
2024 

3. 
REHABILITATION OF ROAD D2940 
FROM PHIVA TO MDLADLA IN THE 
NKOMAZI LOCAL MUNICIPALITY IN 

THE EHLANZENI REGION OF 
MPUMALANGA PROVINCE (9.00KM) 

PWRT/2557/23/MP 27 

November 
2023 

27 May 2024 27 August 

2024 

4. 
THE UPGRADING AND EXTENSION 

OF ROAD P216/1 FROM SECUNDA 
TO EMBALENHLE (9.67 KM),IN THE 
GERT SIBANDE DISTRICT OF THE 

MPUMALANGA PROVINCE 

PWRT/2558/23/MP 27 
November 
2023 

27 May 2024 27 August 
2024 

 
5. SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF COLD 

ASPHALT IN 
BOHLABELA,EHLANZENI, NKANGALA 
AND GERT SIBANDE DISTRICTS OF 

THE MPUMALANGA PROVINCE ON 
AS –AND WHEN REQUIRED BASIS 
FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) 

YEARS  

PWRT/1621/24/MP 05 March 

2024 
05 June 

2024 

05 September 

2024 

6. SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF HOT 
ASPHALT IN 
BOHLABELA,EHLANZENI, NKANGALA 

AND GERT SIBANDE DISTRICTS OF 
THE MPUMALANGA PROVINCE ON 
AS –AND WHEN REQUIRED BASIS 

FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) 
YEARS 

PWRT/1622/24/MP 05 March 
2024 

05 June 

2024 

05 September 
2024 

7. HIRE OF ROAD CONSTRUCTION 
EQUIPMENT IN MPUMALANGA 

PROVINCE AS AND WHEN 
REQUIRED FOR A PERIOD OF 
THREE YEARS 

PWRT/1624/24/MP 11 March 
2024 

11 June 

2024 

11 September 
2024 

8. SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF 

GUARDRAILS IN 
BOHLABELA,EHLANZENI, NKANGALA 

PWRT/1945/24/MP 11 March 

2024 
11 June 

2024 

11 September 

2024 
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AND GERT SIBANDE DISTRICTS OF 

THE MPUMALANGA PROVINCE ON 
AS –AND WHEN REQUIRED BASIS 
FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) 

YEARS 

9. SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF 
AGGREGATES IN 
BOHLABELA,EHLANZENI, NKANGALA 

AND GERT SIBANDE DISTRICTS OF 
THE MPUMALANGA PROVINCE ON 
AS –AND WHEN REQUIRED BASIS 

FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) 
YEARS 

PWRT/1946/24/MP 11 March 
2024 

11 June 

2024 

11 September 
2024 

10. CONSTRUCTION OF A NEW VERENA 
BRACH OFFICE,VERENA 

C,THEMBISILE HANI LOCAL 
MUNICIPALITY,MPUMALANGA 
PROVINCE 

PWRT/2560/24/MP 11 March 
2024 

11 June 

2024 

11 September 
2024 

11. OFFICE ACCOMMODATION FOR THE 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY 
SAFETY AND SECURITY AND LIASON 
IN BARBERTON AT EHLANZENI 

DISTRICT FOR A PERIOD OF FIVE (5) 
YEARS 

PWRT/2562/24/MP 13 March 

2024 
13 June 

2024 

13 September 

2024 

12. WAREHOUSE FOR THE 
DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AT 

BUSHBUCKRIDGE IN BOHLABELA 
DISTRICT FOR A PERIOD OF FIVE (5) 
YEARS 

PWRT/2563/24/MP 13 March 
2024 

13 June 

2024 

13 September 
2024 

13. OFFICE ACCOMMODATION FOR THE 

DEPARTMENT OF 
HEALTH,BARBERTON IN EHLANZENI 
SUB-DISTRICT FOR A PERIOD OF 

FIVE (5) YEARS 

PWRT/2564/24/MP 13 March 

2024 
13 June 

2024 

13 September 

2024 

14. OFFICE ACCOMMODATION FOR THE 
DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY 
SAFERTY,SECURITY AND LIASON IN 

TONGA AT EHLANZENI DISTRICT 
FOR A PERIOD OF FIVE (5) YEARS 

PWRT/2565/24/MP 13 March 
2024 

13 June 

2024 

13 September 
2024 

15. OFFICE ACCOMMODATION FOR THE 
DEPARTMENT OF 

HEALTH,MBOMBELA IN EHLANZENI 
DISTRICT FOR A PERIOD OF FIVE (5) 
YEARS 

 
 
 

PWRT/2566/24/MP 13 March 
2024 

13 June 

2024 

13 September 
2024 

16. SUPPLY, DELIVERY AND 

COMMISSIONING OF ABNORMAL 
LOAD , HEAVY DUTY 4-AXLE SEMI-
TRAILER WITH A PAYLOAD OF NOT 

LESS THAN 45,000KG WITHIN 
MPUMALANGA PROVINCE FOR A 
PERIOD OF FIVE (05) YEARS. 

PWRT/2567/24/MP 15 March 

2024 
15 June 

2024 

15 September 

2024 

17. SUPPLY,DELIVERY,COMMISSSION 

AND MAINTENANCE OF SELF-
PROPELLED,PNEUMATIC TYRED 
COMPACTION ROLLER,WITH UN-

BALLASTED WEIGHT NOT LESS 
THAN 10,000KG AND BALLASTED 
WEIGHT NOT LESS THAN 25,000KG 

IN THE MPUMALANGA PROVINCE 
FOR A PERIOD OF FIVE (05) YEARS 

PWRT/2568/24/MP 15 March 

2024 
15 June 

2024 

15 September 

2024 
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18. SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF 

PREFABRICATED CULVERTS IN 
BOHLABELA, EHLANZENI, 
NKANGALA AND GERT SIBANDE 

DISTRICTS OF MPUMALANGA 
PROVINCE ON AS AND WHEN 
REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF 

THREE (03) YEARS. 

PWRT/2569/24/MP 15 March 

2024 
15 June 

2024 

15 September 

2024 

19. CONSTRUCTION OF SHANKE 
SECONDARY SCHOOL, IN OAKLEY 
VILLAGE, BUSHBUCKRIDGE LOCAL 

MUNICIPALITY, MPUMALANGA 
PROVINCE. 

PWRT/2573/24/MP 18 March 
2024 

18 June 

2024 

18 September 
2024 
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NOTICE TO ALL PROSPECTIVE SUPPLIERS 
 
 
 Help Desk on 30 days payment 

 
It is law that all suppliers/service providers must be paid within 30 days after receipt of an 

invoice. In order to ensure compliance the Provincial Treasury is introducing a Help Desk to 
record complaints of non-payment of suppliers/service providers after invoices were 
submitted to departments, public entities and municipalities. Service providers must report 

the fact that they have not been paid after having submitted invoices to all government 
institutions. In order to lodge complaints the following should be done; 

 

- Send an e-mail to payme@mpg.gov.za indicating naming the institution where work 

was done, period work done, describing the type of work. You can as well e-mail a copy of 
the invoice. 
 

- Call toll free number 0800 0066 57. This is a government free number to report the non- 
payment of services done indicating the institution where work was done, period work done, 
describing the type of work. 

 
PLEASE NOTE THAT THE HELP DESK HAS BEEN OPERATIONAL FROM THE 01 July 

2016!!!!!!!!! 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

mailto:payme@mpg.gov.za
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General Notice to suppliers: 
 

DO NOT THROW AWAY RECEIPTS FOR TENDER DOCUMENTS.  
 

NO EXCHANGES FOR CANCELLED, WITHDRAWN or RE-ADVERTISED 
TENDERS CAN BE MADE WITHOUT THE ORIGINAL RECEIPT. 

 
APPLICABLE TARIFFS FOR 2020/21 FINANCIAL YEAR 

 
A) The subscription fee for a hard copy of the Provincial Tender Bulletin is charged at R40-00 

for local subscribers and R50-00 for subscribers based in other countries (VAT inclusive) 
per annum;  

B) The tariff charged for the sale of the Provincial Tender Bulletin at the counter is R3-00 each 
(VAT inclusive); and 

  
PLEASE NOTE THAT OUR WEBSITE ADDRESS HAS CHANGED FOR VIEWING 
BULLETINS: http://treasury.mpg.gov.za  

 
 

 
 

 KINDLY NOTE THAT THE WEBSITE: https://etenders.treasury.gov.za  

 IS NOW AVAILABLE FOR DOWNLOADING OF BID DOCUMENTS. 
 

 
 

 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

http://treasury.mpg.gov.za/
https://etenders.treasury.gov.za/
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BUSINESS OPPORTUNITIES 

Information on available business opportunities and 
other business support services, particularly for the 

small business sector and Co-operatives, can be 
sought from the Enterprise Development Directorate, 
at the Department of Economic Development, 

Environment and Tourism. The contact details are as 
follows: 

 

Enterprise Development Directorate 
Department of Economic Development, 
Environment and Tourism 
Private Bag X11215 
Mbombela 
1200 

 

Telephone Numbers: (013) 766 4482 / 4443/ 
4803 / 4812 / 4813 or 4831 

REGISTRATION OF 

BUSINESS ENTITIES 
 

Companies and Intellectual Property 
Commission (CIPC) 
(A member of the Department of Trade and 
Industry) 
P.O. BOX 429 
Pretoria 
0001 

Telephone Number: (012) 394 9973 
Email: info@cipc.co.za 

REGISTRATION 

FOR VALUE 

ADDED TAX 

(VAT) 

 

 

 

Any Business Entity doing 
business with Government 
must register for Value Added 
Tax (VAT). 
Government will not do 
business with an entity that 
does not comply with this 
requirement. 
South African Revenue 
Services (SARS) 

 
Private Bag 11294 
Mbombela 
1200 

 

Telephone Number: 
(013) 759 4351 
 

 

 

Where to find support and information 
Business entities can seek assistance from institutions indicated  

 

below: 
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FUNDING 
 

MPUMALANGA ECONOMIC GROWTH 
AGENCY 
P O Box 5838 
Mbombela 
1200 
Telephone number: (013) 755 1731 
Or regional offices: (013) 752 6413 
Witbank: (013) 656 3231 
Secunda: (017) 634 8458 

 

KHULA ENTERPRISE FINANCE 
LIMITED 
P O Box 28423 
Sunnyside 
0132 
Telephone number: (012) 394 5901 
Mbombela: (013) 755 2370 
 

NATIONAL YOUTH DEVELOPMENT 
AGENCY 
 
Shop no 8 Nedbank Centre 
30 Brown Street, Mbombela, 1200 
Telephone number: (013) 756 0100 
 
SMALL ENTERPRISE FINANCE AGENCY 
 
P O BOX 138  
MBOMBELA 
1200 

Mbombela Branch: 
Tel: (013) 755 2370 

CIDB  
 

For Construction and 
Industry Development 

Board (CIDB) grading and 
registration related 

enquiries, please contact 
the CIDB office on the 

numbers indicated below, or 
visit their website for more 

information: 
 
 

Mbombela Offices: 
086 1678 222 

 
Mbombela, 30 Brown Street 
Nedbank Building, 9th Floor 

(with Public Works) 
 

 
Pretoria Head Office: 

Tel: 012 482 7200 
Fax: 011 252 6944 

Fraudline: 0800 112432 
Registers Call Centre: 

0860 103 353 
 

Website: 
www.cidb.org.za 

http://www.cidb.org.za/
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THE ANTI-CORRUPTION 

TOLL FREE NUMBER: 

080 070 1701 
 

 


